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2.16.13 Improvements 

If you have any questions or would like more information on any of the items described here, please contact 
the iTacit Help Desk (helpdesk@itacit.com). 

Improvements and Fixes 

General Configuration 

Employee Manager: Fixed Formatting of Compliance Date Entry Pop-Up (HCM-19618) 

Resolved a UI issue where the Compliance Date Entry pop-up was not displaying correctly, affecting usability 
and visual consistency. The pop-up is now properly formatted, ensuring a smoother and more accessible 
experience when entering compliance dates. 

Standardized Error Handling for Improved System Reliability (HCM-19286) 

Updated backend error handling to follow consistent best practices, ensuring clearer and more secure 
responses across the platform.  

Optimized Password Field Behavior for Secure and Efficient Login (HCM-19288) 

Enhanced platform security and performance by enabling best practices for password fields. Specifically, 
password fields now have autocomplete disabled, reducing the risk of credential exposure on shared or public 

devices.  

mailto:helpdesk@itacit.com
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Forms & Checklists 

Fixed Checklist Requirement Not Retained in New Versions or Copies (HCM-19699) 

Resolved an issue where the "Require all answers to be selected (like in a checklist)" checkbox in the Form 

Builder was not retained when creating a new version or copying a form. This fix ensures checklist behavior 
settings are preserved, reducing rework and maintaining form consistency. 

Fixed Duplicate Data in “Export with Answers” from Form Submission Manager (HCM-

19112) 

Resolved an issue where exporting form submissions with answers from the Form Submission Manager 
resulted in duplicate data appearing across multiple columns for all rows. This fix ensures clean, accurate 
exports, supporting reliable data analysis and reporting. 

Fixed Export Including Skipped Sections from Conditional Logic (HCM-19170) 

Resolved an issue where form exports included sections that were skipped due to conditional logic, resulting 
in unnecessary or misleading data in the output. This fix ensures that only the sections actually presented to 
the user are included in the export, improving data accuracy and relevance. 

Fixed Image Display in Export Preview and PDF Export (HCM-19109) 

Resolved an issue where images added in the Form Builder Sections were not appearing in the Export Preview 
or PDF Export. This fix ensures that all embedded images are correctly rendered in exported formats.  

Fixed Issues with Circular Workflows and Conditional Questions (HCM-19511) 

Resolved a problem where circular workflows and conditional questions were not functioning as expected. 
This fix ensures that workflows can loop correctly and conditional logic behaves reliably, improving form 
accuracy and user experience. 

Fixed Missing Text Styling and Images in Form Library Item Descriptions (HCM-19167) 

Resolved an issue where text coloring and pasted images added to Form Library Item descriptions in the 

Admin site were not appearing in the 2.0 interface. This fix ensures that rich text formatting and embedded 
visuals are consistently displayed, preserving the intended presentation across views.  

Fixed Secondary User Issue When Copying Sections from Another Form (HCM-17982) 

Resolved an issue where secondary user assignments were not retained correctly when a section was copied 
from another form. This fix ensures that all user roles and permissions are preserved during section reuse, 

thereby maintaining workflow integrity and reducing the need for manual reconfiguration.  
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Fixed Section Copy Spinner Display Issue (HCM-19523) 

Resolved a UI issue where the loading spinner appeared behind the Section Copy window in the Admin App. 
The spinner now displays correctly in the foreground, improving visual feedback during section duplication.  

Optimized Form Submission Process for Faster Performance (HCM-19475) 

Improved the backend handling of form submissions to reduce processing time and enhance responsiveness.  

Optimized “Select Employee Subject” Lookup for Faster Form Loading (HCM-19474) 

Improved the performance of the “Select Employee Subject” lookup field by optimizing how employee data is 
retrieved and displayed. This enhancement significantly reduces load times for forms using this field, 
especially in environments with large employee directories. 

Restored Photo Upload Support on Older Android Versions (HCM-19129) 

Resolved an issue where users on older Android devices were unable to take and upload photos as form 
attachments in the Mobile App. This fix restores compatibility, ensuring all users can capture and submit 
images directly within forms, regardless of their Android OS version. 

Restricted the Discard Form Option to Self-Enrolled Forms Only (HCM-18781) 

Addressed an issue where end users could discard forms that were purposefully assigned to them. Now, only 
self-enrolled forms from the Library can be discarded by the user, ensuring that assigned forms remain in their 

My Activities section until completed or expired, supporting accountability and compliance. 
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Training & Education 

Knowledge Programs: Fixed One-Time Knowledge Program Assignment Blocked by 

Withdrawn History (HCM-17543) 

Resolved an issue where a one-time Knowledge Program (KP) assignment would not trigger if the employee 
had previously withdrawn from the same KP. This fix ensures intended one-time KP assignments are delivered 

regardless of past withdrawal status, supporting consistent training delivery.  

Library: Fixed Connectivity Error When Organizing Courses by Topics (HCM-19590) 

Resolved an issue where selecting the Organize by Topics checkbox in the Courses section connectivity error. 
Users can now group courses by topic without interruption, improving navigation and course management.  

Training Catalog Item: Fixed Transcript Overwrite on Re-enrollment with Sessions (HCM-

19303) 

Resolved an issue where a completed transcript without sessions was unintentionally overwritten when 
sessions were later added to a Training Course Item and the user re-enrolled. This fix ensures transcript 
integrity and preserves accurate training history. 


